
13-1

TITLE 13

PROPERTY MAINTENANCE REGULATIONS1

CHAPTER 
1. PROPERTY MAINTENANCE CODE.
2. [REPEALED.]
3. [REPEALED.]
4. [REPEALED.]
5. [MOVED TO TITLE 19.]
6. [REPEALED.]

CHAPTER 1

PROPERTY MAINTENANCE CODE

SECTION
13-101. Property maintenance code adopted.
13-102. Local modifications.
13-103. Available in recorder's office.
13-104. Violations.
13-105.--13-110. Deleted.

13-101. Property maintenance code adopted. Pursuant to the
authority granted by Tennessee Code Annotated,§§ 6-54-501 through 6-54-510
and for the purpose of regulating and governing the conditions and maintenance
of all property, buildings and structures; by providing the standards for supplied
utilities and facilities and other physical things and conditions essential to
ensure that structures are safe sanitary and fit for occupation and use; and the
condemnation of buildings and structures unfit for human occupancy and use,
and the demolition of such existing structures, the International Property
Maintenance Code,2 2018 edition as prepared and adopted by the International
Code Council is hereby adopted and incorporated herein by reference as a part
of the ordinances of the City of Maryville. This code shall hereinafter be known
as property maintenance code. It is adopted subject to the changes and additions
set forth herein. (1985 Code, § 8-401, as replaced by Ord. #2013-24, Oct. 2013,
and Ord. #2018-22, July 2018 Ch17_2-5-19)

1Municipal code references
Animal control:  title 10.
Littering streets, etc.:  § 16-107.

2Copies of this code (and any amendments) are available from the
International Code Council, 900 Montclair Road, Birmingham, Alabama 35213.



13-2

13-102. Local modifications. The following sections and appendices of
the International Property Maintenance Code, 2018 edition, are hereby
amended in the City of Maryville, as hereinafter provided:

(1) Chapter 1, Scope and Administration: Section 101.1 Title. is hereby
amended locally in the City of Maryville by inserting "City of Maryville" as the
name of the jurisdiction.

(2) Chapter 1, Scope and Administration: Section 103.5 Fees. is hereby
amended locally in the City of Maryville by deleting the section in its entirety
with no replacement.

(3) Chapter 1, Scope and Administration: Section 106.3 Prosecution of
violation. is hereby amended locally in the City of Maryville by deleting the
section in its entirety and replacing with:

"Prosecution of violation. Any person failing to comply with a notice of
violation or order served in accordance with Section 107 shall be deemed
guilty of a misdemeanor and of a violation of the City Code. If the notice
of violation is not complied with the Code Official may in his discretion
institute the appropriate proceeding at law or in equity to restrain,
correct, or abate such violation or to require the removal or termination
of the unlawful occupancy of the structure in violation of the provisions
of this Code or of the order or direction made pursuant thereto. Any
action taken by the authority having jurisdiction on such premises shall
be charged against the real estate upon which the structure is located and
shall be a lien upon such real estate."
(4) Chapter 1, Scope and Administration: Section 106.4 Failure to

comply. is hereby amended locally in the City of Maryville by deleting the
section in its entirety and replacing with:

"Violation Penalties. Any person who shall violate a provision of this Code
or fail to comply therewith or of any of the requirements thereof shall be
prosecuted within the limits provided by state or local laws and may be
penalized pursuant to the general penalty clause of the City of Maryville.
Each day that violation continues after due notice has been served shall
be deemed a separate offense regardless of whether an additional citation
has been issued. If the City must resort to the equitable relief to abate a
violation, the violator should be liable to the City for the City's reasonable
attorney's fees and litigation expenses in bringing and prosecuting the
equitable action.
Additionally, violators may in the discretion of the City be subject to fines
and penalties to be imposed by the Administrative Hearing Officer
pursuant to T.C.A. §6-54-1001 et seq. as adopted locally in the City Code." 
(5) Chapter 1, Scope and Administration: Section 108.2 Closing of

vacant structures. is hereby amended locally in the City of Maryville by
inserting after Section 108.2.1 a new section as follows:

"108.2.2 Boarding of abandoned structures. All windows and doors of
abandoned structures shall be boarded in an approved manner to prevent
entry by unauthorized persons. Boarding sheet material shall be



13-3

minimum 1/2-inch (12.7 mm) nominal thick wood structural panels
complying with the International Building Code."
(6) Chapter 1, Scope and Administration: Section 109.6 Hearing. is

hereby amended locally in the City of Maryville by deleting the last sentence in
its entirety with no replacement.

(7) Chapter 1, Scope and Administration: Section 111 Means of Appeal.
is hereby amended locally in the City of Maryville by deleting the section and
all of its subsections in their entirety with no replacement.

(8) Chapter 1, Scope and Administration: Section 112.4 Failure to
comply. is hereby amended locally in the City of Maryville by deleting the
section in its entirety and replacing with:

"Failure to comply. Any person who shall continue any work after having
been served with a stop work order, except such work as that person is
directed to perform to remove a violation or unsafe condition, shall be
subject to penalties as prescribed by law and the enforcement section and
penalty clause of this Ordinance." 
(9) Chapter 3, General Requirements: Section 302.4 Weeds. is hereby

amended locally in the City of Maryville by deleting the first paragraph in its
entirety and inserting the following in its place:

"All mowable parcels or mowable portions of parcels of a parcel located in
the City limits, shall be maintained free from weeds or plant growth in
excess of twelve (12) inches. 
Parcels that are three (3) acres or larger and are adjacent to the city
rights-of-way or adjacent to a parcel which contains an existing dwelling
within one hundred fifty (150) feet of the larger parcel shall have a fifty
(50) feet setback from the shared property line that shall be maintained
free from weeds or plant growth in excess of eighteen (18) inches.
However, parcels three (3) acres or larger shall mow the entire parcel at
least two (2) times during growing season.
Mowable shall mean all parcels other than heavily wooded parcels where
equipment cannot maneuver because of the natural density of the
vegetation. Slopes where the gradient is steeper than three units
horizontal to one unit vertical (33%) shall not be considered mowable.
The requirements of this section shall apply only to the extent that they
do not conflict with the City of Maryville's Stormwater Quality
Management Plan and stormwater regulations City Code Title 19 as
amended which shall both supersede the provisions of this part.
This section does not apply to government owned property including
greenways, parks and recreation areas nor does it apply to active and
bona fide agricultural uses for livestock, crops or plant nurseries.
Further, this section shall not apply to properties that legitimately
qualify for and have Greenbelt classification for tax assessment purposes.
(10) Chapter 3, General Requirements: Section 302.6 Exhaust vents. Is

hereby amended locally in the City of Maryville by deleting the entire section
and replacing with:



13-4

302.6 Wood smoke. Wood smoke (smoke coming from the burning of
wood) shall not be permitted to escape one commercially operated
property and come on to abutting or adjacent public or private property
where such wood smoke:

1. Is detectable by sight or smell below the roof lines or 15 feet
above grade, whichever is less, at the affected neighboring
buildings or structures; and

2. Results in complaints from owners or tenants of such
abutting or adjoining property.

A person or entity producing such wood smoke will not be considered in
violation of this ordinance if there exists on its property for each wood
smoke producing fire:

1. A properly functioning, and at least 15 foot high chimney,
smoke stack, flue or chute directing the wood smoke
upward; and a functioning commercial grade exhaust fan to
disburse the wood smoke to a higher altitude; or

2. Any commercially designed system or device, such as a
scrubber, that removes particulate matter. Persons or
entities producing wood smoke as part of participation in a
city-approved special event are exempted from the
provisions of this ordinance.

(11) Chapter 3, General Requirements: Section 302.9 Defacement of
property. Is hereby amended locally in the City of Maryville by inserting at the
end: 

"All graffiti shall be removed or the surface repainted to match the
existing surfaces."
(12) Chapter 3, General Requirements: Section 302 Exterior property

areas. is hereby amended locally in the City of Maryville by inserting at the end
a new section as follows:

"302.10. Junkyards. All junkyards and other places where vehicles or
scrap is collected before being discarded, reused or recycled shall be
operated and maintained subject to the following regulations:

(1) All vehicles, junk and/or scrap stored or kept in such yard
shall be kept so that they will not catch and hold water in
which mosquitoes may breed and so that they will not
constitute a place in which rats, mice, or other vermin may
be harbored, reared, or propagated.

(2) All such junkyards shall be enclosed within close fitting
plank or metal solid fences touching the ground on the
bottom and being not less than six (6) feet in height. Such
fence is to be built so that it will be impossible for stray cats
and/or stray dogs to have access to such junkyards. 
Additionally, such fence shall be subject to any other
regulations that are provided in the City of Maryville



13-5

Municipal Code or Maryville Land Development
Regulations.

(3) All such junk yards within one thousand (1,000) feet of any
right-of-way within the municipality shall be screened by
natural objects, plantings, fences, or other appropriate
means so as not to be visible from the right-of-way. 
Additionally, such screening, plantings, or fences shall be
subject to any other regulations that are provided in the
City of Maryville Municipal Code or Maryville Land
Development Regulations.

(4) Such yards shall be so maintained as to be in a sanitary
condition and so as not to be a menace to the public health
or safety." 

(13) Chapter 3, General Requirements: Section 304.14 Insect screens.
is hereby amended locally in the City of Maryville by inserting "January 1 to
December 31" as the dates to be inserted.

(14) Chapter 6, Mechanical and Electrical Requirements: Section 602.3
Heat supply. is hereby amended locally in the City of Maryville by inserting
"January 1 to December 31" as the dates to be inserted.

(15) Chapter 6, Mechanical and Electrical Requirements: Section 602.4
Occupiable work spaces. is hereby amended locally in the City of Maryville by
inserting "January 1 to December 31" as the dates to be inserted. (1985 Code,
§ 8-405, as replaced by Ord. #2013-24, Oct. 2013, and Ord. #2018-22, July 2018
Ch17_2-5-19)

13-103. Available in recorder's office. The Council of the City of
Maryville hereby declares that one ( 1) copy of the aforesaid code and revisions,
as modified, has been filed with the Recorder of the City for a period of fifteen
(15) days prior to the passage of this ordinance, that it will remain on file as long
as this ordinance is in effect and that all public hearing and notice requirements
in Tennessee Code Annotated, § 6-54-501 et seq. have been or will be met by the
time of the final passage of this ordinance. (1985 Code, § 8-406, as replaced by
Ord. #2013-24, Oct. 2013, and Ord. #2018-22, July 2018 Ch17_2-5-19)

13-104. Violations. Any person, firm, corporation, tenant, occupant or
agent who shall violate a provision of this code or fail to comply therewith or
with any of the requirements thereof or cause such action to be taken in
violation of the provisions of this code adopted by reference or locally adopted
as modified shall be deemed guilty of a separate offense for each and every day
or portion thereof during which any violation is committed or continued. Upon
being found guilty of such violation, such person shall be punished according to
the general penalty clause of the City of Maryville or through injunctive
remedies in state or federal court as appropriate. In the event court action is
taken, the city shall be entitled to recover from any person adjudicated to have



13-6

violated this chapter the city's reasonable attorney fees and litigation costs
incurred in bringing the action(s) to enforce the provisions of this chapter.

Additionally, violators may in the discretion of the city be subject to fines
and penalties to be imposed by the administrative hearing officer pursuant to
Tennessee Code Annotated, § 6-54-1001 et seq. as adopted locally in the city
code. (1985 Code, § 8-407, as amended by Ord. #2001-35, Nov. 2001, and
replaced by Ord. #2010-13, April 2010, Ord. #2013-24, Oct. 2013, and Ord.
#2018-22, July 2018 Ch17_2-5-19)

13-105.--13-110. Deleted. (as deleted by #2018-22, July 2018
Ch17_2-5-19)



13-7

CHAPTER 2

[REPEALED]

(This chapter was repealed by Ord. #2013-24, Oct. 2013)



13-8

CHAPTER 3

[REPEALED]

(This chapter was repealed by Ord. #2013-24, Oct. 2013)



13-9

CHAPTER 4

[REPEALED]

(This chapter was repealed by Ord. #2013-24, Oct. 2013)



13-10

CHAPTER 5

[MOVED TO TITLE 19.]1

1Grading, soil erosion and sedimentation control was moved in
conjunction with Change 8, April 1, 2008.



13-11

CHAPTER 6

[REPEALED]

(This chapter was repealed by Ord. #2013-24, Oct. 2013)


